
                                                                                        OASC 12/18 /2011  

Meeting opened @ 3:00 pm with the Serenity Prayer  

12 concepts & 12 Traditions

Approval of last month’s minutes (additions or corrections)   

Minutes approved by Christi H. & 2nd by Tina T.

Roll Call:

Officers Present: Chair: Mark J., Secretary: Marsha B, Treasurer: Jackie C.          

Officers Absent: RCM (Tammy)

Officers Vacant: Vice Chair &RCM Alt.

Subcommittee Chairs Present: H&I (Jocelyn), AASC (Mike), PI (Danny), Website 
Coordinator (Tom H.)                                                                   

Subcommittee Chairs Absent: None

Subcommittee Chair Vacant: Literature Review& Out Reach Chair 

Groups Present: But Do It, Clean & Serene, Miracles, Point of Turning, Stray Katz, 
Survivors, Under Grace, We Do Recover

Groups Absent: 5th Tradition

Groups Inactive: None

Groups off rooster: A New Way, Better Perspective, Butterflies are Free& Together in 
Unity

Quorum: 8-9

Recognition of New Groups: None

ADMINISTRATIVE REPORTS

Treasurer Report:  DECEMBER2011     (Meeting of November29th2011)

Balance………….. $ 1,506.22                Balance ending November 29th area report. 

Total Deposits……$    150.00               Donations & credits from Nov.29th meeting

Total Expenses…..$    357.23                Expenses since November 29th & last meeting



Current Balance… $ 1,298.99                 Balance as of Dec.18th 2011 meeting.

DONATIONS                                            EXPENSES

 But Do It……….... $       20.00               $ 143.68 RSO/H &I/Ck#8

 5Th Tradition……...$       50.00               $   30.19 Kwik Copy/schedules/Ck#9

Point of Turning…..$       10.00               $   57.65 Freedom Voice/Ck#10

Stray Kat…………. $       25.00               $     1.00 Bank Service Charges

Under Grace………$       20.00            

We Do Recover…...$      25.00               $357.23 TOTAL EXPENSES                 

TOTAL DONATIONS...$150.10

In Loving Service,

Jackee P. Area Treasurer

Chair: No report

Secretary: No Report

RCM: Absent

SUBCOMMITTEE REPORTS

H&I Chair: H&I meet today @ 2pm @ We Do Recover. Meeting opened with Serenity 
Prayer. 12 Traditions & 12 Concepts were read. Attendance taken. Last meeting 
minutes read-MSP to approve. Jocelyn will pick up lit. @ Regional. H&I panel 
coordinator reports: Christi reports Thanksgiving meeting missed. Lit. Rack filled. 
Christie& Julie going to Lafayette House the last of the month. Jocelyn is approved to 
go in. Brian reports for Jasper County, one male meeting missed. Good participation 
with men’s meeting. Need more women on the panel. Old Business: Suggested Area 
Chair share @ our H&I Speaker Jam, Date set is April 21, 2012. Will discuss place for 
speaker jam our next meeting. No New Business. Meeting closed with the 3rd step 
prayer. In Loving Service, Jocelyn B.

 AASC Chair: Hello Ozark Area. We opened our meeting w/ a moment of silence 
followed by the Serenity Prayer, 12-Concepte& 12-Traditions of N.A. Area will be 
having a New Year’s Eve bash December 31st,2011 @ H.O.U.S.E. Inc.( Airport House 
26706 State Hwy171) doors open @ 6pm. Suzanne G. will be our speaker @ 8pm. 
There will be a 50/50 raffle, & dancing following the speaker. Artwork for the 2012 



H.O.L.P. was voted upon & fliers will be out soon. Our next meeting will be @ 1pm 01-
15-2012. We closed with the Third Step Prayer. In Loving Service, Mike O.

PI Chair: PI Subcommittee met today@ 12:30pm 8addicts present. The meeting 
opened w/ the Serenity Prayer. Pat H. Said the phone line was ok. There were 21 
calls. Shelly is off the phone line. I got some Literature Racks @ Office Depot. Jackee 
said the check had cleared for the literature order, so I should be getting the order 
anytime. Pat is going to look into putting some lit. @ The Ozark Center, Physiatrist 
Unit. P.I. is going to plan some workshops after the Regional meeting in January. In 
Loving Service, Danny C.

Website Coordinator: Tom H. gave a verbal report. Website is up & running.

GROUPS REPORT:

BUT DO IT: Hello Ozark Area, But Do it meets Wed. nights @ 6:30pm @ 414 Virginia. 
Attendance is up again to about 30 addicts. All meetings are closed except the last 
Wed. of the month, which is birthday night. We have no Birthday this month, except 
Dennis D. who might be picking up his 7 yr. medallion. We have a donation of $26.00. 
In Loving Service, Kelly S.

Clean & Serene: Group doing well. Got some lit. & posters. Meeting is held @ Alana 
Club for recovery @ 1800 E. 30th St. @ 6:30pm Saturday’s. The group needs support 
from other members. Group has 25.00 for Area. In loving Service, Mike M.

Miracles: Hello Ozark Area, My name is Kelly Y.GSR for Miracles group of N.A. We 
meet @ 6:30pm every Fri. night. Our business meeting is the 2nd Fri. every month 
following meeting. Birthday meeting is the last Fri. of the month. Attendance is good 
ranging from 30-55 every meeting. We are located @ 7th & Virginia @ Life Impact 
Church. We don’t have an area donation due to needing to purchase literature. In 
Loving Service, Kelly Y.

Point Of Turning: Hello Ozark Area, Meeting is still on the corner of spring & main in 
El Dorado Springs in the bottom building Tues. @ 7pm & Thurs. @ 8pm. We are 
averaging 12-15 addicts per meeting & message is being carried. The first Tues. is our 
speaker meeting & the first Thur. is book study. The group is doing well this month & 
we have a $10.00 donation to give. ILS, Tina T.

Stray Katz: Hello family! Addict named Kim for Stray Katz. Our meetings our doing 
great with attendance of between 25-50addicts every Sat. @ 6:00pm. Our business 
meeting is the 3rd Sat. of the month @ 5:15pm. We still have T-shirts available for 
$20.00 each & we also have NA lit. for sale. We would love to have you come join us! 



We don’t have a donation this month but we brought lots of pizza! Also we will be 
having our meeting on New Year’s Eve in the building behind the main house where 
the party will be. ILS, Kim M. today!  In Loving Service, Kim M.

Survivors: Hello Ozark Area, I’m an addict named Christi serving as GSR for 
Survivor’s group. Our meetings are held @ 1330 S. wall Joplin, Mo. Survivors meet 
Mon-Sat @ noon. We are a non-smoking group. Wed& Fri. we have book study 
meetings. All others are open discussion. The last Sat. of the month is a B-Day 
celebration. Our attendance varies. Thanks for the support. Keep coming back. 
Survivors are planning to have the sweetheart dance. Attentively Feb.11 th 2012. We 
will have a special meeting the 1st week of Jan. to make more plans. So more will be 
revealed. Business Meeting is the Sat. after noon meeting before Area. Love & 
Service, Christi H.

Under Grace: Hello Area, My name is Danny W. I represent the Under Grace Group of 
Carthage. We meet every Mon. @ 7pm in the basement of Grace Episcopal Church on 
the corner of Howard & Chestnut. It’s a non-smoking open meeting. Our attendance 
ranges from 8 to 12 people, our donation for the Area this time is $20.00. In loving 
Service, Danny W.

WE Do Recover: Hello Area, I’m Raymond an addict. We Do Recover meets @ 
1330on Wall st. Meetings are every night 2@ 8pm& F-S 12 mid-night. So far meeting 
attendance is going good. On the 25th of Dec. the doors of We Do Recover will be open 
@ 11am, food, fun& fellowship. It will be a Pot Luck. We have a donation of $84.00. 

Sharing Session: None

Old Business: Budgets were taken back to the groups to be voted on as follow: H&I 
800.00, P&I 900.00, Treasurer $75.00, Sec.150.00, Website coordinator $400.00, Lit. 
Review $100.00, Outreach Chair $100.00, RCM Intern $900.00& General Area 
Expenses $250.00 TOTAL BUDGETS $3,875.00 & motion to add Addendum 
regarding Treasure also taken back to be voted on.

New Business: Both were approved & Chair is going to see if Tammy was going to 
still be RCM

Next OASC Meeting is Jan.15th @ 3pm @ Eldorado Springs, Mo.with Point of 
Turning hosting.

                                                 Subcommittees meet directly before Area

                                                   PI: 12:30



                                                   AASC: 1pm 

                                                   H&I 2pm

CURRENT TRUSTED SERVANTS CONTACT LIST

Chair                            Mark J.                                          PO Box 452 Joplin, Mo.64802

Treasurer                     Jackee P            529-1863            jackeekaye95@gmail.com

Secretary                     Marsha B.           296-3009           marshmellow332@yahoo.com 

RCM                            Tammy M.                                   TammyMoody13@hotmail.com

H&I Chair                     Jocelyn B.          499-0780       3121/2 W.14th Joplin, Mo. 64804

AASC Chair                 Mike O.                                         ori-m001@mymail.mssu.edu

PI Chair                       Danny C.                              P.O.Box 1104 Carthage, Mo. 64836

Website Coordinator    Tom H.              540-1138        MATDEFENDER@GMAIL.COM

But Do It                      Kelly S.                                           KShepardx10@att.net  

Clean & Serene           Brady M.                                       BJMorris@freemanhealth.com 

5th Tradition                 Kenny Mc             673-5819          McNamara101@sbcglobal.net

Miracles                      Kelly Y.                  396-1471                        bonni-Clyde@att.net

Point Of Turning          Tina T.                  876-6888            tinapellegrin@yahoo.com

Stray Katz                   Kim M.                                            merrykim46@yahoo.com

Survivors                     Christi H.              438-0264        2333 Arizona Joplin, Mo. 64804 

Under Grace               Danny W.                            P.O. Box 1104 Carthage, Mo. 64836

We Do Recover          Raymond M.                              314 W.14th St. Joplin, Mo. 64804

mailto:jackeekaye95@gmail.com
mailto:tinapellegrin@yahoo.com
mailto:marshmellow332@yahoo.com


The Following OASC Positions are open:

                                      OASC Vice Chair (2 yrs clean time required)

                                           Term: Oct.-Oct./ No nominations @ this time

                            (Will need to serve till 10/11 & resubmit resume if interested)

                                      RCM Alternate (3years clean time required)

                                           Term: May- May/ No nominations @ this time

                                      RCM (4yrs. clean time required)

                                          Term: May-May/No nominations @ this time

                                    Literature Review Chair (2 yr. clean time required)

                                          Term: May-May/ No nominations @ this time

                                   Outreach Chair (2yrs. clean time required)

                                         Term: May –May/No nominations @ this time

Attend your group’s next business meeting to ask about these positions or … Attend 
the next OASC meeting Sunday Jan.15th, 2012@The corner of Spring & Main El 
Dorado Springs, Mo.

                                     

.


